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Privacy Notice   

 
The personal data you have provided in this form (“Personal Data”) will be processed for the purpose 
of processing your insurance application/proposal, provision of insurance related products or services 
or any addition, alteration, variation, cancellation, renewal or reinstatement thereof, performing 
statistical/actuarial research or data study, promoting products and services and other related 
purposes (collectively, “Purpose”). 

 
Although you are not obliged to provide us with your Personal Data, we will not be able to process 
your application for insurance cover or process your claim if you fail to provide all requested 
information.  
 
Your Personal Data may be disclosed to any related company or any other company carrying on 
insurance or reinsurance related business or an intermediary or a claims or investigation or other 
service provider and to any association, federation or similar organisation of insurance companies that 
exists or is formed from time to time for the Purpose or to fulfil some legal or regulatory function or is 
reasonably required in the interest of the insurance industry. 
 
We may also disclose your Personal Data where such disclosure is required under the law, court 
orders or pursuant to guidelines issued by regulatory or other relevant authorities, if we reasonably 
believe that we have a lawful right to disclose your Personal Data to any third party or that we would 
have had your consent for such disclosure if you had known of the same, and/or if the disclosure is in 
the public interest.  
 
Please be informed that your Personal Data may also be transferred to any of our related companies 
which may be located outside Malaysia for the Purpose. In the event that we use external service 
providers, specific security and confidentiality safeguards have been put in place to ensure your 
privacy rights remain unaffected.   
 
You may make inquiries, complaints or request for access to or correction of your Personal Data or 
limit the processing of your Personal Data at any time hereafter by submitting such request to our 
email at customerservice@pacificinsurance.com.my 
 
We trust that you will consent and agree to the terms above with respect to the processing of your 
Personal Data.  [If we do not receive any response from you on the above, we shall assume that you 
are agreeable to the same as otherwise we will not be able to proceed to the next steps pertaining to 
your matter with us.] 

 
 
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT AND CONSENT 
 
I have read and understood the terms of this Privacy Notice and consent to the processing of my 
Personal Data as described above. 
 
 
 
 
……………………………………….     
Signature     Full Name: ……………………………. 
 
Date: ……………………………….  NRIC No.: ……………………………. 
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